9/12/24, 8:59 AM Email IAIN PAREPARE - Re: Reminder Email IJOR

ST.AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@iainpare.ac.id>

Re: Reminder Email IJOR

5 pesan

International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk> 9 Desember 2023 pukul 01.24
Kepada: "ST.AMINAH 2020106201" <staminah@iainpare.ac.id>

Dear Aminah, Greetings!

Thank you for your email.
We have already sent you the acceptance letter but you didn't receive it so we are sending you again.

Best wishes,
Dr. Harper Smith, Managing Editor

On behalf of the Editorial Committee
International Journal of Religion

ISSN: 2633-352X | e-ISSN: 2633-3538
Whatsapp No.: +60 19-356 6762
Scopus Indexed

Scopus URL: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101158583
Website URL: https://ijor.co.uk

On Fri, 8 Dec 2023 at 21:37, ST.AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@iainpare.ac.id> wrote:

Dear Harper Smith
Managing editor
International Journal of Religion

Thank you for confirming the receipt of our article, but we are sorry we have not received a letter of acceptance (LOA)
and invoice for payment.

Best Regards

---------- Forwarded message ---------

Dari: ST AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@iainpare.ac.id>
Date: Jum, 8 Des 2023 14.58

Subject: Re: Reminder Email IJOR

To: International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk>

Dear Harper Smith
Managing editor
International Journal of Religion

Thank you for confirming the receipt of our article, but we are sorry we have not received a letter of acceptance
(LOA) and invoice for payment.

Best Regards

Pada Jum, 8 Des 2023 pukul 13.15 International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk> menulis:
Dear Author, Greetings!

Thank you for your paper submission in International Journal of Religion (IJOR).

As your paper was accepted based on blind peer review process and invoice was sent along with acceptance
letter for March 2024 issue. However we didn't receive your fee for publication till now. If you wish to be included
in March 2024 issue. Please submit your fee then we will proceed your paper for further publication process. Now
we are finalizing our upcoming issue and If we didn't receive your registration fee untill December 15, 2023, your
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paper will not considered for publication in March issue and it will be shifted to June issue and other accepted
papers will be given a chance to replace your paper in the issue. So if you want to publish your paper in March
issue please make payment before given date.

For further assistance please feel free to contact us on WhatsApp or email.
Best wishes,
Dr. Harper Smith, Managing Editor

On behalf of the Editorial Committee
International Journal of Religion

ISSN: 2633-352X | e-ISSN: 2633-3538
Whatsapp No.: +60 19-356 6762
Scopus Indexed

Scopus URL: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101158583
Website URL.: https://ijjor.co.uk

3 lampiran

.@ Invoice IJOR-023-1095.pdf
165K

.@ Review Report IJOR-023-1095.pdf
152K

.@ Acceptance Letter IJOR-023-1095.pdf
476K

ST.AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@iainpare.ac.id> 9 Desember 2023 pukul 10.19

Kepada: International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk>

Dear Dr. Harper Smith
Managing editor
International Journal of Religion

Thank you for your confirmation of the acceptance of the article in the International Journal of Religion, we are of
course very happy with the acceptance of the article. If possible, can our article be published in the December edition
of Vol. 4 No. 2 2023? We hope it can be published in that edition and we will immediately complete the payment.

Warm regards

Pada Sab, 9 Des 2023 pukul 00.24 International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk> menulis:
Dear Aminah, Greetings!

Thank you for your email.
We have already sent you the acceptance letter but you didn't receive it so we are sending you again.

Best wishes,
Dr. Harper Smith, Managing Editor

On behalf of the Editorial Committee
International Journal of Religion

ISSN: 2633-352X | e-ISSN: 2633-3538
Whatsapp No.: +60 19-356 6762
Scopus Indexed

Scopus URL: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101158583
Website URL: https://ijor.co.uk

On Fri, 8 Dec 2023 at 21:37, ST.AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@iainpare.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Harper Smith

Managing editor
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International Journal of Religion

Thank you for confirming the receipt of our article, but we are sorry we have not received a letter of acceptance
(LOA) and invoice for payment.

Best Regards

---------- Forwarded message ---------

Dari: ST AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@iainpare.ac.id>
Date: Jum, 8 Des 2023 14.58

Subject: Re: Reminder Email IJOR

To: International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk>

Dear Harper Smith
Managing editor
International Journal of Religion

Thank you for confirming the receipt of our article, but we are sorry we have not received a letter of acceptance
(LOA) and invoice for payment.

Best Regards

Pada Jum, 8 Des 2023 pukul 13.15 International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk> menulis:
Dear Author, Greetings!

Thank you for your paper submission in International Journal of Religion (IJOR).

As your paper was accepted based on blind peer review process and invoice was sent along with acceptance
letter for March 2024 issue. However we didn't receive your fee for publication till now. If you wish to be
included in March 2024 issue. Please submit your fee then we will proceed your paper for further publication
process. Now we are finalizing our upcoming issue and If we didn't receive your registration fee untill
December 15, 2023, your paper will not considered for publication in March issue and it will be shifted to June
issue and other accepted papers will be given a chance to replace your paper in the issue. So if you want to
publish your paper in March issue please make payment before given date.

For further assistance please feel free to contact us on WhatsApp or email.
Best wishes,
Dr. Harper Smith, Managing Editor

On behalf of the Editorial Committee
International Journal of Religion

ISSN: 2633-352X | e-ISSN: 2633-3538
Whatsapp No.: +60 19-356 6762
Scopus Indexed

Scopus URL: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101158583
Website URL: https://ijor.co.uk

ST.AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@jiainpare.ac.id> 10 Desember 2023 pukul 14.57
Kepada: International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk>

Pada Sab, 9 Des 2023 10.19, ST AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@iainpare.ac.id> menulis:
Dear Dr. Harper Smith
Managing editor
International Journal of Religion

Thank you for your confirmation of the acceptance of the article in the International Journal of Religion, we are of
course very happy with the acceptance of the article. If possible, can our article be published in the December
edition of Vol. 4 No. 2 2023? We hope it can be published in that edition and we will immediately complete the
payment.
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Warm regards

Pada Sab, 9 Des 2023 pukul 00.24 International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk> menulis:
Dear Aminah, Greetings!

Thank you for your email.
We have already sent you the acceptance letter but you didn't receive it so we are sending you again.

Best wishes,
Dr. Harper Smith, Managing Editor

On behalf of the Editorial Committee
International Journal of Religion

ISSN: 2633-352X | e-ISSN: 2633-3538
Whatsapp No.: +60 19-356 6762
Scopus Indexed

Scopus URL: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101158583
Website URL.: https://ijor.co.uk

On Fri, 8 Dec 2023 at 21:37, ST.AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@iainpare.ac.id> wrote:

Dear Harper Smith
Managing editor
International Journal of Religion

Thank you for confirming the receipt of our article, but we are sorry we have not received a letter of acceptance
(LOA) and invoice for payment.

Best Regards

---------- Forwarded message ---------

Dari: ST AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@iainpare.ac.id>
Date: Jum, 8 Des 2023 14.58

Subject: Re: Reminder Email [JOR

To: International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk>

Dear Harper Smith
Managing editor
International Journal of Religion

Thank you for confirming the receipt of our article, but we are sorry we have not received a letter of acceptance
(LOA) and invoice for payment.

Best Regards

Pada Jum, 8 Des 2023 pukul 13.15 International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk> menulis:
Dear Author, Greetings!

Thank you for your paper submission in International Journal of Religion (IJOR).

As your paper was accepted based on blind peer review process and invoice was sent along with
acceptance letter for March 2024 issue. However we didn't receive your fee for publication till now. If you
wish to be included in March 2024 issue. Please submit your fee then we will proceed your paper for further
publication process. Now we are finalizing our upcoming issue and If we didn't receive your registration fee
untill December 15, 2023, your paper will not considered for publication in March issue and it will be shifted
to June issue and other accepted papers will be given a chance to replace your paper in the issue. So if you
want to publish your paper in March issue please make payment before given date.

For further assistance please feel free to contact us on WhatsApp or email.
Best wishes,
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Dr. Harper Smith, Managing Editor

On behalf of the Editorial Committee
International Journal of Religion

ISSN: 2633-352X | e-ISSN: 2633-3538
Whatsapp No.: +60 19-356 6762
Scopus Indexed

Scopus URL: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101158583
Website URL.: https://ijor.co.uk

ST.AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@iainpare.ac.id> 14 Desember 2023 pukul 13.51
Kepada: International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk>

Dear Dr. Harper Smith
Managing editor
International Journal of Religion

Thank you for your acceptance of the article in the International Journal of Religion, we are of course very happy with
the acceptance of the article. We have completed the payment fee of our article and we hope it will be publish soon

Warm regards

.@ CamScanner 14-12-2023 12.29.pdf
432K

International Journal of Religion Editor <editor@ijor.co.uk> 14 Desember 2023 pukul 14.10
Kepada: "ST.AMINAH 2020106201" <staminah@jiainpare.ac.id>

Dear Aminah, Greetings!

Thank you for your email.
We have received your payment receipt. Your paper has been forwarded for the formatting process.

Best wishes,
Dr. Harper Smith, Managing Editor

On behalf of the Editorial Committee
International Journal of Religion

ISSN: 2633-352X | e-ISSN: 2633-3538
Whatsapp No.: +60 19-356 6762
Scopus Indexed

Scopus URL: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101158583
Website URL.: https://ijor.co.uk

On Thu, 14 Dec 2023 at 10:52, ST AMINAH 2020106201 <staminah@iainpare.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Dr. Harper Smith
Managing editor
International Journal of Religion
Thank you for your acceptance of the article in the International Journal of Religion, we are of course very happy with
the acceptance of the article. We have completed the payment fee of our article and we hope it will be publish soon

Warm regards
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